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Dear Editor,

We reviewed the correspondence entitled “AI Chatbots in 
Treatment Decision-making for Acquired Bilateral Vocal 
Fold Paralysis: Correspondence.”1 The authors discussed 
the methodology of our paper entitled “Evaluating the 
Potential of AI Chatbots in Treatment Decision-making for 
Acquired Bilateral Vocal Fold Paralysis in Adults,”2 and 
they suggested that the lack of openness in the Chatbot’s 
decision-making process, and the lack of information 
about the AI models’ calibration and training are major 
flaws of the study. We thank the authors for sharing their 
opinion. In this letter, we wish to draw attention to few 
points.

We agree that the lack of information on the hy
perparameters of ChatGPT-3.5, 4.0., and Llama 2.0 can 
make it difficult for researchers or health care providers to 
analyze the performance of Chatbots. This point does not 
only concern our study but all studies that assessed such 
Chatbots in providing medical or surgical information. 
However, this study was not conducted to better under
stand the functioning and performance of Llama 2.0 and 
ChatGPT-4.0. The study was conducted to evaluate the 
performance of Chatbots in providing medical or surgical 
information dedicated to the management of clinical 
vignettes. In this clinical way and from a pragmatical 
standpoint, the lack of knowledge of the hyperparameters 
does not discourage people, including patients, from get
ting information about the disease and seeking advice re
garding treatment from Chatbots. This reality makes 
particular sense for such a rare condition as bilateral vocal 
fold paralysis (BVFP), which is characterized by the lack of 
consensus on the management and treatment of the con
dition.3 Thus, the conclusion of our study could help pa
tients with BVFP to be cautious when considering the 
potential outputs of Chatbots in regard to their condition.

This point is particularly important as ChatGPT-4.0 was 
found to report moderate-to-high accuracy in some 
common otolaryngological conditions.4–6 For example, the 
largest cohort study of real clinical cases submitted to 
ChatGPT-4.0 recently suggested a strong consistency 
(k  >  0.600) between otolaryngologists and ChatGPT-4 for 
the indication of some additional examinations (ie, upper 
aerodigestive tract endoscopy, positron emission tomo
graphy and computed tomography, audiometry, tympa
nometry, and psychophysical evaluations), while the 
primary diagnosis was correctly performed by ChatGPT-4 
in 38% to 86% of cases depending on subspecialty.4 In 
rhinology, ChatGPT-4 proposed plausible and correct 

primary diagnoses in 62.5% cases,5 while in laryngology, 
ChatGPT had the highest performance for proposing a 
primary (90%) or the most plausible differential diag
noses (65%), and the therapeutic options (60%–68%).6

These studies, with abstracts easily available through a 
Google search, may encourage patients to trust the 
Chatbot’s performance in providing accurate clinical in
formation. The conduction of such studies assessing the 
accuracy of Chatbots in the management of specific and 
rare conditions, or in providing medical or surgical in
formation, carries a great value for clinical practice and 
patient use of Chatbots despite the lack of information on 
hyperparameters.
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